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This is a resolution adopted by the Town Board of the Town of Yorktown at its regular meeting held

on March 17, 2026.

Whereas, Bids were received on March 13, 2026 for Ultraviolet Lamp Replacements Disinfection
System Lenses and Maintenance Parts for the Water Pollution Control Plant, bid #26-1, and are

summarized below.

BIDDER QUANTITY /ITEM TOTAL PRICE
UltraTech Systems 128 - UV Lamps $18,329.60
UltraTech Systems 128 - Quartz Sleeves $8.166.40
Lumar P &H 256 — Sleeve Cup Nut $1,167.36
Lumar P &H 256 - O-Ring Sleeve Seal $1,152.00
Lumar P &H 256 — O-Ring Sleeve Support $552.96
Lumar P &H 10 — Plug - UV3+PDC Module 6’ $7.791.60
Lumar P &H 16 - Lamp Holder Amalgam 4 Wire $2,053.60
Lumar P &H 16 — Lamp Driver - Ballast $25,446.40
NO BID 16 - Lamp Driver Ballast Repair NO BID
Lumar P &H 8 — Module MCB UV3+220-227V $3,428.72
NO BID 6 — CCB UV3+ Board Assembly Kit NO BID
Lumar P &H 4 —  Acticlean Cleaning Agent $2,132.20
Lumar P &H 1 — Injector Gel UV 3+ $330.70
Lumar P &H 4 — Injector Tip Fitting 90 Degree Elbow $137.28
Lumar P &H 8 -  Receptacle UV3+ 2007 $2,558.24
Lumar P &H 6 -  Sensor Sleeve Washer $208.92
Lumar P &H 32 - Plastic Fitting (2 Per Canister) $70.40
Lumar P &H 16 — Fitting — Plastic 90 Degree Elbow $596.80
Lumar P &H 64 — Seal Kit UV 3000 Plus Plastic Canister $32,032.51
Lumar P &H 4 - Sensor ASSY, UV3+NIST $16,329.76
Lumar P &H 4 - Sensor Rear Mount Kit (Complete w/Cable | $3,512.88
Assy)
Lumar P &H 144 — Lamp Kit GA64T6HE Flat Base $11,204.64
Lumar P &H 4 —  Sensor Cable Kit UV3+NIST (C/W Cable | $1,203.68
& Grommet)
Lumar P &H 16 - End Cap, Ballast Enclosure UV3+Power $835.58
Lumar P &H 16 - End Cap Ballast Enclosure UV3+Plain $1,116.32
Lumar P &H 32 - End Cap Ballast Enclosure UV3+ $2.844.16
Lumar P &H 16 - Spacer Clip $939.04
Lumar P &H 8 - Stainless Steel Compression Ring $290.00




Resolved, the following items are to be Trojan O & M or equivalent; and

Resolved, that the bid for 128 UV Lamps be awarded to UltraTech Systems, Inc., at a total bid price
of $18,329.60; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for 128 Quartz Sleeves, be awarded to UltraTech Systems, Inc.,
at a total bid price of $8,166.40; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for 256 Sleeve Cup Nut be awarded to Lumar Plumbing &
Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $1,167.36; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 256 O-Ring Sleeve Seal be awarded to Lumar Plumbing
& Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $1,152.00; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 256 O-Ring Sleeve Support be awarded to Lumar
Plumbing & Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $552.96; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 10 Plug — UV3+PDC Module 6’ be awarded to Lumar
Plumbing & Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $7,791.60; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 16 Lamp Holder Amalgam 4 Wire be awarded to Lumar
Plumbing & Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $2,053.60; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 8 Lamp Driver Ballast be awarded to Lumar Plumbing &
Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $25,446.40; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 8 Module MCB UV3+220-227V be awarded to Lumar
Plumbing & Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $3,428.72; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 4 Acticlean Cleaning Agent be awarded to Lumar
Plumbing & Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $2,132.20; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 1 Pressure Injector Gel UV3+ be awarded to Lumar
Plumbing & Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $330.70; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 4 Tip Fitting 90 Degree Elbow be awarded to Lumar
Plumbing & Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $137.28; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 8 Receptacle UV3+ 2007 be awarded to Lumar Plumbing
& Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $2.558.24; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 6 Sensor Sleeve Washer be awarded to Lumar Plumbing
& Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $208.92; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 32 Plastic Fitting 2 Per Canister be awarded to Lumar
Plumbing & Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $70.40; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 16 Plastic 90 Degree Elbow be awarded to Lumar
Plumbing & Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $596.80; and



Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 64 Seal Kit UV3000 Plus ™ Plastic Canister be awarded
to Lumar Plumbing & Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $32,032.51; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 4 Sensor Assy UV3+NIST (C/W Box) be awarded to
Lumar Plumbing & Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $16,329.76; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 4 Sensor Rear Mount Kit Complete with Cable Assy be
awarded to Lumar Plumbing & Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $3,512.88; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 144 Lamp Kit GA64T6HE Flat Base be awarded to Lumar
Plumbing & Heating, Inc., a total bid price of $11,204.64; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 4 Sensor Cable Kit UV3+NIST C/W Cable & Grommet
be awarded to Lumar Plumbing & Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $1,203.68; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 16 End Cap Ballast Enclosure UV3+ Power, be awarded
to Lumar Plumbing & Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $835.58; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 16 End Cap Ballast Enclosure UV3+ Plain be awarded to
Lumar Plumbing & Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $1,116.32; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 32 End Cap Ballast Enclosure UV3+ be awarded to Lumar
Plumbing & Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $2,844.16; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 16 Spacer Clips can be awarded to Lumar Plumbing &
Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $939.04; and

Be It Further Resolved, that the bid for the 8 Stainless Steel Compression Spring be awarded to Lumar
Plumbing & Heating, Inc., at a total bid price of $290.00; and

Be It Further Resolved, that there were no bids submitted for 16 Trojan Lamp Driver (Ballast) Repair
Trojan O&M Part #NEDAP-Type 954700; and

Be It Further Resolved, that there were no_bids submitted for 6 Trojan CCB UV3+ Board Assembly
Kit Trojan O&M Part #931092; and

Be It Further Resolved, the bid start date is March 23, 2026.

Diana L. Quast, Town Clerk
Master Municipal Clerk

Date: March 18, 2026

To:  Charlie Callahan, Lumar Plumbing & Heating Inc.
Greg Ellner, UltraTech Systems, Inc.

cc: Edward A. Lachterman, Town Supervisor
Dan Ciarcia, Town Engineer
Gennelle MacNeil, Town Comptroller
Adam Rodriguez, Town Attorney
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